

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rainwear
 FOR:
 TIME & (Date of Award through July 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 20, 2018
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Airgas 335 N WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78219	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Drive, Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78233	Saf-T-Glove, Inc. 1001 Avenue R Grand Prairie, TX 75050	Alamo Distribution, LLC dba Alamo Iron Works 943 AT&T Center Parkway San Antonio, TX 78219	Promo Solutions 11104 Windjammer Dr. Frisco, TX 75036	Ritz Safety, LLC 5516 Business Park San Antonio, TX 78218	Sunbelt Mill Supply	Meister Supply 3453 N Pan Am Expwy Suite 213 San Antonio, TX 78219	San Antonio Lighthouse for the Blind 2305 Roosevelt Ave. San Antonio, TX 78210	R&R Industries, Inc. 204 Avenida Fabricante San Clemente, CA 92672
1.	10 ea. Trench coat, medium, with hood and SAWS emblem, Classic Plus 260C, length 60 inches, Lawson No. 34253	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	12.06 120.60	13.98 139.80	15.15 151.50	18.06 180.60	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED NOT AN APPROVED EQUALS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.	20 ea. Trench coat, large, with hood and SAWS emblem, Classic Plus 260C-L, length 60 inches, Part #K02116, Lawson No. 34254	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	12.06 241.20	13.98 279.60	15.15 303.00	18.06 361.20						
3.	10 ea. Trench coat, x-large, with hood and SAWS emblem, Classic Plus 260C-XL, length 60 inches, Part #K01813, Lawson No. 34255	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	12.06 120.60	13.98 139.80	15.15 151.50	18.06 180.60						
4.	10 ea. Trench coat, xx-large, with hood and SAWS emblem, Classic Plus 260C-2XL, length 60 inches, Lawson No. 34256	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	12.06 120.60	13.98 139.80	15.15 151.50	18.06 180.60						
5.	10 ea. Tranch coat, xxx-large, with hood and SAWS emblem, Classic Plus 260C-3XL, length 60 inches, Lawson No. 34257	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	12.77 127.70	13.98 139.80	15.93 159.30	19.00 190.00						
6.	10 ea. Trench coat, xxxx-large, with hood and SAWS emblem, Classic Plus 260C-4XL, length 60 inches, Lawson No. 34258	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	13.40 134.00	13.98 139.80	17.93 179.30	12.90 129.00						
7.	80 ea. Rain pant, medium, Classic 200BP Part #200BPM SAWS Item #14572	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.40 272.00	3.39 271.20	3.80 304.00	7.62 609.60						
8.	150 ea. Rain pant, large, Classic 200BP Part #200BPL SAWS Item #14577	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.40 510.00	3.39 508.50	3.80 570.00	7.62 1,143.00						
9.	150 ea. Rain pant, x-large, Classic 200BP Part #200BPXL SAWS Item #14578	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.40 510.00	3.39 508.50	3.80 570.00	7.62 1,143.00						
10.	150 ea. Rain pant, xx-large, Classic 200BP Part #200BPX2 SAWS Item #14573	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.40 510.00	3.39 508.50	3.80 570.00	7.62 1,143.00						
11.	75 ea. Rain pant, xxx-large, Classic 200BP Part #200BPX3 SAWS Item #14574	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.72 279.00	3.39 254.25	4.16 312.00	8.05 603.75						
12.	60 ea. Rain pant, xxxx-large, Classic 200BP Part #200BPX4 SAWS Item #14575	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.89 233.40	3.39 203.40	4.36 261.60	8.28 496.80						
13.	60 ea. Rain pant, xxxxx-large, Classic 200BP Part #200BPX5 SAWS Item #14576	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.05 243.00	3.39 203.40	4.55 273.00	8.49 509.40						
14.	75 ea. Rain Jacket with Hood Yellow Medium, 200JHM and SAWS emblem per specifications SAWS Item #13257	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.65 348.75	6.62 496.50	7.44 558.00	9.49 711.75						
15.	150 ea. Rain Jacket with Hood Yellow Large, 200JHL and SAWS emblem per specifications SAWS Item #13256	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.65 697.50	6.62 993.00	7.30 1,095.00	8.71 1,306.50						

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rainwear
 FOR: (Date of Award through July 31, 2019)
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 20, 2018
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Airgas 335 N WW White Rd. San Antonio, TX 78219	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Drive, Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78233	Saf-T-Glove, Inc. 1001 Avenue R Grand Prairie, TX 75050	Alamo Distribution, LLC dba Alamo Iron Works 943 AT&T Center Parkway San Antonio, TX 78219	Promo Solutions 11104 Windjammer Dr. Frisco, TX 75036	Ritz Safety, LLC 5516 Business Park San Antonio, TX 78218	Sunbelt Mill Supply	Meister Supply 3453 N Pan Am Expwy Suite 213 San Antonio, TX 78219	San Antonio Lighthouse for the Blind 2305 Roosevelt Ave. San Antonio, TX 78210	R&R Industries, Inc. 204 Avenida Fabricante San Clemente, CA 92672
16.	200 ea. Rain Jacket with Hood Yellow X-Large, 200JHXL and SAWS emblem per specifications SAWS Item #13259	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.65 930.00	6.62 1,324.00	7.30 1,460.00	8.71 1,742.00	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED NOT AN APPROVED EQUALS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
17.	200 ea. Rain Jacket with Hood Yellow 2-XL, 200JH2X and SAWS emblem per specifications SAWS Item #13252	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.07 1,014.00	6.62 1,324.00	7.30 1,460.00	8.71 1,742.00						
18.	100 ea. Rain Jacket with Hood Yellow 3-XL, 200JH3X and SAWS emblem per specifications SAWS Item #13253	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.54 554.00	6.62 662.00	7.84 784.00	9.34 934.00						
19.	100 ea. Rain Jacket with Hood Yellow 4-XL, 200JH4X and SAWS emblem per specifications SAWS Item #13254	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.80 580.00	6.62 662.00	8.12 812.00	9.68 968.00						
20.	75 ea. Rain Jacket with Hood Yellow 5-XL, 200JH5X and SAWS emblem per specifications SAWS Item #13255	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	6.05 453.75	6.62 496.50	8.40 630.00	10.02 751.50						
	TOTAL BID	TOTAL	7,998.48	9,394.35	10,755.70	15,026.30						
	EXTENSION 1		7,998.48									
	EXTENSION 2		7,998.48									
	EXTENSION 3		7,998.48									
	Terms		Net 30 days	2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days						
	Delivery Days		5 days	1-2 days	10 days	3-5 days						

***LOW BIDDER**

BIDS INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Airgas
 Alamo Iron Works
 Conney Safety
 Furball Wear LLC dba Styles of TX
 MCR Safety
 Meister Supply
 Promo Solutions
 Ritz Safety LLC

SA Lighthouse for the Blind
 Safety Supply Inc.
 Saf-T-Glove Inc.
 Sunbelt Mill Supply
 UMI Direct
 Uniforms Mfr. Inc.
 Wesco

Demandstar
 SAWS Website